I 4. ST.ud.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5 -21.Te1.-31.-29042021-226788
CG-DL-E-29042021-226788

HHTETIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AW [I—Evs 3—39-GVs (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee T THfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T, 241) 7% fReeht, ggeufEm, stder 29, 2021/49m@ 9, 1943
No. 241] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, APRIL 29, 2021/VAISAKHA 9, 1943
T 3T SR {ATAT

75 fReet, 28 arder, 2021

TT.H1.. 299(37).—Fra Twhe, FH=AT wiasy [fdr s gt sueer srfafaarm, 1952 (1952 =1
19) FT GTT 7 F ITLATT (1) F AT q15T IT 67 T Ve AFadi w1 TIRT Fd g0 FHART e
Tegdg ATHT ThiH, 1976 FT 3T FHIMLT FIA 6 (70 et T st g, T2 -

1. (1) =9 ThI¥ FT Giereq 910 FHATL HAT Tgag S 97 (Feree) Thd, 2021 7 |

(2) 78 T 2 F @ (@) & IT@T (iv) & ST 15 ®Eadt, 2020 & Y goll HHAT ST, Fam Toma= §
IEF TR T ATEE HT g gt |

2. FHATL (AeT ggag S18T Thid, 1976 (S S0H T8 TATq 37 ThiH Tl TAT §) & I27 22 F IT-977
(3) ¥, -

(F) ST T | “Tah g1 TITAT | TS H AT 9ea1 o €T 9T “THT0SIT § A7 9767 T S0,

(@) == () &, -

(i) “rer I[OTT STERT o TATH U “GATE IO 9157 T STUA;
(ii) “=T T FIEAAT AT AAte, ST A FH S SR AT AT AT ST,

2420 G1/2021 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(iii)) “TH AT TATH AT TI” 93T o AT U2 “TH AT TAgcq¥ goll¥ w94’ 9768 TG S0,

(iv) T T & T MHfeted qiqa ia: e o STuam, =T 15 %3adt, 2020 7 e
AT FHAT STTUAT, AT -

‘o AT TR &7 AT T3 g &9 & FH qgl g’

(V) T TqF |, “Gg AT@ T9F” a1 AT I “H7q A9 T4 9768 T S0 |

3. I ThIW & 937 28 F U7 (4) F @ (i) H, “Furg wiasy [ SAgF” a1y F 9=+ AT AT
Far wiaey [t sraa (qeamed) a7 Afaiad e Sieey [fd srea” os3 37 Fisss s end &y
ST |

4. IFT ThHIH o G 29 T AT GHid |, “AT AT 9" 9T5&[ % T X “ToA 16 g ¥ 7q3” 98 T
ST |

5. I ThH & 9T 22 % 39-037 (3) # U 70 Ferrge | Hafaq o7 ST & 9T (2) F ITAH TH ThiA &
TS | YT il A & i a9 ahl Tatd o o Jged gi |

[FT. 9. 3T-16011/1/2020-T9TH-11]

AT, o, I[edT, §ad qr=a

feoqur « F=ETT MET ggag ST R, 1976 AT F TSI, AT, 9T 10, 9 3, IUET (i) #
ar.%1.19. deats 488(3), TG 28 FeTs, 1976 FTRT THIAT it T2 AT 3T T SATaw Ferra srfeg==r
T AL, 286 (31), aTE 4 o8« 2019 =T AT 3T o |

TR FTaT

ARG & T&9A, FATER, AN 1, @< 3, 3@ (i), @ 15 ®asd, 2018 § s(fe=r qedi®
araL|. 170(37), I 15 wEadt, 2018 T THMT AT TR ® 98 3T TSR HATAT il
STfere=aT T =AaH AT ST it stiereraw AT v &1 av i srafer F o ggre & 9 = gw e
T T AT AT AT, ST 14 Ba<T, 2020 T TA g e o e Saa SqEdT &7 Fiaear I8 F3d

& SIS o [olT 7 FTed ThiA & T 2 % @< (&) & 3U€e (iv) F 15 By, 2020 § AT 91
= T g, S foneT =ta & At 9% afage sama T8t ST

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 28th April, 2021

G.S.R. 299(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the

Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976, namely:—

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette, except sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of
paragraph 2, which shall be deemed to have come into force on the 15™ day of February, 2020.

2. In the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the said Scheme), in paragraph
22, in sub-paragraph (3),—

(a) in the opening portion, for the words “who was in employment of the same establishment”, the words “and
was in employment” shall be substituted,



[\ [I—0E 3(i)] HTL T (ST TETLTI0T 3

(b) in clause (i),—
(i) for the words “thirty times”, the words “thirty-five times” shall be substituted;
(i1) the words “or during the period of his membership, whichever is less” shall be omitted;

(iii) for the words “one lakh and fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh and seventy-five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(iv) before the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been
inserted with effect from the 15™ day of February, 2020, namely:—

“Provided that the assurance benefit shall not be less than two lakh and fifty thousand rupees:”;

(v) in the second proviso, for the words “six lakh rupees”, the words “seven lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.

3. In the said Scheme, in paragraph 28, in sub-paragraph (4), in clause (i), after the words “Central Provident Fund
Commissioner”, the words and brackets “or Additional Central Provident Commissioner (Head Quarters) or Additional
Central Provident Fund Commissioner” shall be inserted.

4. In the said Scheme, in paragraph 29, in the long line, for the words “four thousand rupees”, the words “twenty-five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. The provisions of paragraph 2 of this Scheme relating to amendments made thereto in sub-paragraph (3) of paragraph
22 of the said Scheme shall be in force for a period of three years with effect from the date of publication this Scheme
in the Official Gazette.

[F. No. R-16011/1/2020-SS-1I]
R. K. GUPTA, Jt. Secy.

Note:— The Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R. 488(E), dated the 28 July, 1976 and was last
amended vide notification number G.S.R. 286(E), dated the 4™ April, 2019.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

Vide the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Labour and Employment number G.S.R. 170(E),
dated the 15™ February, 2018 published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-section (i), dated
the 15" February, 2018, the minimum assurance benefit ceiling was increased to two lakh and fifty thousand rupees for
a period of two years, which expired on the 14™ February, 2020. Therefore, for the purpose of giving continuity to the
said benefit, sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of paragraph 2 of this amendment Scheme is given effect to retrospectively
from the 15" day of February, 2020, which will not adversely affect the interests of any person.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  MANOJkumaR:




		2021-04-29T16:53:13+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




